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Partners and Friends 
Dear Partners 
and Friends:                           
 

2022 is here, 
what are you 
going to do for 
God this year?  
What you do for 
your neighbour 
you have done 
unto God.  Let 
me tell you 

something, there is no shortage of 
money for us as Christians in the 
world today because our Saviour is 
God.  Let me remind you that 1 
Peter 5:7 says “casting all your care 
upon him; for he careth for you.” 
What that means is rest in God and 
he will take care of you. 
 

Our Faith Home in Ghana is in the 
final phase and I am excited when I 
think of the boys who will have a 
place to call home for 6 months 
after leaving jail.  They will be 
trained in different jobs to get them 
ready to go back into the 
community to help themselves and 
to be a blessing to others.  We need 
to give these kids a chance.  We 
want to see their lives changed for 
God.  Mark 16:15 “Go ye into the 
world and preach the Gospel to 
every creature.” 

 

 
 
Partners we want to thank you also 
for being there to support the work 
we are doing for God. Please 
remember to pray for us. 
 

You are Blessed! 

 

Val 

Focused and 
Encouraged 

So here we are, another year has 
come and gone.  These past couple 
of years have been challenging to 
say the least.  Despite what’s 
happening all around us, and as 
dark as it may seem, remember that 
God never changes.  He is the same 
yesterday, today and forever. 
Hebrews 13:8 
 

There seems to be many questions, 
but not many answers. That’s okay, 
because God has the answers.  We 
are not to lean on our own 
understanding.  Proverbs 3:5 I 
implore you to read 2 Timothy 3:1-
6, Matthew 24:3-8.  We all go 
through tribulation but be of good 
cheer, for the Lord has overcome 
the world.  Be vigilant on where 
your attention is, what are you 
giving your attention to?  Who are 

 

 

 you listening to?  What words are 
you speaking?  Remember who you 
are in Christ regardless of what 
people are saying or how you’re 
feeling.  God loves you more than 
you or I could ever imagine.  Be 
strong in the Lord. Ephesians 6:10-
18 
 

In 2022, be encouraged to live one 
day at a time putting God first.  
There may be ups and downs, 
sometimes we get things right and 
sometimes we miss the mark, either 
way, God always has and always will 
Love you! 
 

 

Have a happy and blessed New 
Year! 

 

Kaysha       

 

Testimony  
I just wanted to share this quick 
testimony to keep people 
encouraged to stay focused on God 
and to cast all your cares to him for 
he cares for you, and he will take 
care of your every need. Over the 
past year it hast been a real testing 
time where the enemy was 
constantly trying to turn me from 
God. Not everyone knows, but I am 
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Our mission is to bring the Good 
News of God’s great love to those 
in prisons-- His Son Jesus has 
paid the price for their freedom. If 
they will just believe and receive, 
they shall be free to go and tell all 
of His great love for them through 
the teaching and preaching of the 
Word, and to show them through 
aids of help and kindness. 

Canadian Office: 

Abundantly Blessed & Valerie 
Hibbert Ministries 

Box 9077 

London, ON N6E 2V0   Canada 

Phone/Fax:  519-686-4668 

African Contact: 

Abundantly Blessed & Valerie 
Hibbert Ministries 

Mr. Kojo A. Gaisie 

Director / Financial Controller 

P.O. Box 19156 

Accra North Ghana, West Africa 

Cell: (021)244-366-523 

an Auto Worker and due to the 
pandemic, my factory has been 
closed for most of the year. At first, 
I was strong in the Lord and I had 
no cares in the world, but week 
after week went by then, month 
after month, I tried looking for work 
and had some calls for interviews 
but nothing worked out. As the 
months went by, the enemy kept 
nagging saying, “how are you going 
to pay for food, or gas, or the 
mortgage?” It was tough, but the 
more he kept trying to turn me 
from God, tough as it was, I stayed 
focused on Him and His word. After 
a long struggle people, I want to tell 
you a job opportunity came up that 
gave me a little, but in all the time I 
was off guess what?  God supplied 
all my need, regardless of what the 
devil was telling me, God supplied 
the food, the clothing for my back, 
the gas for my car and my 
mortgage. So, if you are feeling 
down because of all the stuff in the 
world, remember, turn to God and 
he will bring you through! 

 

Be Blessed! 

Darryl 

 

Christmas 
Donation 

Thank you to our Partners and 
Friends, because of your support of 
ABVHM we were able to donate 
clothing and non-perishable food 
items to Humana Community 
Services. 

Prayer for Salvation 

If you would like to make Jesus 
your Saviour and Lord, simply 

pray the following prayer in faith 
out loud. 

Heavenly Father, I come to you in 
the Name of Jesus.  Your Word 
says, “Whosoever shall call upon 
the name of the Lord shall be 
saved” (Acts 2:21).  I am calling 
on You.  I ask Jesus to come into 
my heart and be Lord over my life 
according to Romans 10:9-10.  “If 
thou shalt confess with thy mouth 
the Lord Jesus, and shall believe 
in thine heart that God has raised 
him from the dead, thou shalt be 
saved.”  I do that now.  I confess 
that Jesus is Lord, and I believe in 
my heart that God has raised Him 
from the dead. 

I am now reborn!  I am a new 
creation—a child of almighty God!  
I am saved!  I am now in the 
Kingdom of God—a member of 
the body of Jesus—the Church. 

If you prayed this prayer, please 
write us and let us know—we 
have a gift for you. 
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Annual Fellowship 
Breakfast 

 
June 2022 

 
 

(Details to follow) 

 
 


